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JERR-DAN HOSTS SEMINAR DURING THE 2017 BALTIMORE TOW 
SHOW FOCUSED ON ROTATOR CHALLENGES  

 
Heavy-Duty Senior Sales Manager, Shane Coleman,  

presents solutions for rotator challenges  
 
Hagerstown, MD (November 15, 2017) – Jerr-Dan Corporation, an Oshkosh Corporation 
Company (NYSE:OSK) and a single brand leader in the towing and recovery business, will be 
hosting a seminar exclusively focused on the many challenges faced by rotator operators in the 
United States. Jerr-Dan’s Heavy-Duty Senior Sales Manager, Shane Coleman, will be providing 
answers and solutions for these challenges at the 29th Annual American Towman Exposition in 
Baltimore taking place on November 17-19.  The seminar will be offered on Friday, November 
17 at 10:00 a.m. in room 327 at the Baltimore Convention Center. 
 
The “Rotator Challenges” seminar aims to dissect and share the collective challenges in the 
industry, creating a conversation that will lead to identifying the situations most commonly 
confronted by rotator operators. Through industry study and the fabrication of top-notch 
engineering solutions, Jerr-Dan has developed a rotator line that allows the customer to 
optimize their investment by configuring the unit that best suits their business’s needs. 
 
“We want to provide an opportunity to explore the rotator market, revealing current 
complications while complementing the discussion with clear solutions for these challenges,” 
said Shane Coleman, Heavy-Duty Senior Sales Manager with Jerr-Dan. 
 
Jerr-Dan is engineered to exceed the expectations of the current rotator market, creating 
solutions that prove to tackle these difficulties, offering premium equipment such as the 50/60 
JFB Rotator Product line, an empowering combination of heavy-duty capabilities, superior 
stabilizing technology, commanding rotation, unsurpassed pulling capacity and unstoppable 
power. In addition, Jerr-Dan provides multiple configurations efforts, complementing this 
configurable rotator line through a personalized and systematic way of designing and building 
towing equipment based on the specific performance demands of the business.  
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“We are determined to help rotator operators tackle the scenarios demanded in the industry 
today by providing industry insights,” said Coleman.  
 
As a leading innovator in the towing and recovery industry, Jerr-Dan’s 50/60 JFB rotator 
configurability was engineered to tackle the demands of the every-day job. Visit the booth to 
learn more about the features and benefits of the JFB body and the multiple configurations 
available.   
 
For more information on Jerr-Dan products visit the website at www.jerrdan.com.    
 
About Jerr-Dan Corporation 
Jerr-Dan Corporation, an Oshkosh Corporation [NYSE: OSK] company, is a leading 
manufacturer of towing and recovery equipment. Its full line includes light-, medium- and heavy-
duty carriers and wreckers, industrial transporters and four-car carriers.  The company is 
headquartered in Hagerstown, MD., and its products are backed by industry leading warranties 
and a strong service network dedicated to the towing professional. To learn more about Jerr-
Dan, visit www.jerrdan.com. 
 
About Oshkosh Corporation 
Founded in 1917, Oshkosh Corporation is 100 years strong and continues to make a difference 
in people’s lives. Oshkosh brings together a unique set of integrated capabilities and diverse 
end markets that, when combined with the Company’s MOVE strategy and positive long-term 
outlook, illustrate why Oshkosh is a different integrated global industrial.  The Company is a 
leader in designing, manufacturing and servicing a broad range of access equipment, 
commercial, fire & emergency, military and specialty vehicles and vehicle bodies under the 
brands of Oshkosh®, JLG®, Pierce®, McNeilus®, Jerr-Dan®, Frontline™, CON-E-CO®, 
London® and IMT®.  

Today, Oshkosh Corporation is a Fortune 500 Company with manufacturing operations on four 
continents. Its products are recognized around the world for quality, durability and innovation, 
and can be found in more than 150 countries around the globe.  As a different integrated global 
industrial, Oshkosh is committed to making a difference for team members, customers, 
shareholders, communities and the environment. For more information, please visit 
www.oshkoshcorporation.com. 

®, TM All brand names referred to in this news release are trademarks of Oshkosh Corporation or 
its subsidiary companies. 
 
Forward-Looking Statements  

This press release contains statements that the Company believes to be “forward-looking 
statements” within the meaning of the Private Securities Litigation Reform Act of 1995. All 
statements other than statements of historical fact, including, without limitation, statements 
regarding the Company’s future financial position, business strategy, targets, projected sales, 
costs, earnings, capital expenditures, debt levels and cash flows, and plans and objectives of 
management for future operations, are forward-looking statements. When used in this press 
release, words such as “may,” “will,” “expect,” “intend,” “estimate,” “anticipate,” “believe,” 
“should,” “project” or “plan” or the negative thereof or variations thereon or similar terminology 
are generally intended to identify forward-looking statements. These forward-looking statements 
are not guarantees of future performance and are subject to risks, uncertainties, assumptions 
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and other factors, some of which are beyond the Company’s control, which could cause actual 
results to differ materially from those expressed or implied by such forward-looking statements.  
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